
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Date: 19 December 2024 Our Reference:  FOI 125 24-25 

    
Enquiries to: Information Compliance Officer  

  
 
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000  
 
Dear  
 
We are writing in respect of your application for the release of information held by the Service, 
which we received on 21 November 2024. We can confirm that we have now completed our 
search for the information requested and hold the data unless noted below. Please find our 
answers in red.  
 
You asked:  
 
I would be grateful if you could provide responses to the following questions: 
 

1. How many motor vehicles are owned by the service as of November 2024? 467 
 

2. How many electric vehicles (including hybrid) are owned by the service as of November 
2024? 48 Electric and 24 Hybrid. 

 
3. The manufacturer name of electric vehicles bought by the service up to November 

2024? TOYOTA, VAUXHALL, SKODA, PEUGEOT, NISSAN, KIA  
 

4. How much has your service spent on electric vehicles up to November 2024? 
£1,258,565.65 

 
5. What are electric vehicles used for in your service? General duties across the Service 

including within the pool fleet. We have also started to use electric vehicles as officer 
response vehicles. 

 
6. How many electric vehicles does the service plan to purchase in the five-year period to 

March 2030? Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service does not hold this 
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information as it is unknown at this stage and will depend on budgets set. Therefore, 
we are unable to provide you with this as per Section 1 of the Freedom of Information 
Act 2000. 

 
7. What budget has your service allocated to purchase electric vehicles every year up to 

March 2030? Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service does not hold this 
information as it is unknown at this stage. Therefore, we are unable to provide you with 
this as per Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

 
The above concludes our investigation into this matter. 
 
Any future correspondence with Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service in 
relation to this matter should be sent to the Information Compliance Officer at the above 
address.  
 
If for whatever reason you are unhappy with our response you may request an internal review 
by contacting DP@hantsfire.gov.uk or by writing to the Data Protection Officer at the above 
address. 
 
Should you remain dissatisfied you can appeal against the internal review decision by 
contacting the Information Commissioners Office. This can be done online at 
www.ico.org.uk/foicomplaints or by post to The Information Commissioner, Wycliffe House, 
Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF. 

   
 
Yours sincerely 

Information Compliance Officer 

Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service 

 

 




