Information Compliance Team
Headquarters
Leigh Road
Eastleigh
Hampshire
SO50 9SJ
Sent by email to:

] t. 02380 644000
e. DP@hantsfire.gov.uk
w. hantsfire.gov.uk

Date: 30 January 2024 Our Reference: FOI 140 23-24

Enquiries to:  Information Compliance Officer

Freedom of Information Act 2000

Dear I

We are writing in respect of your application for the release of information held by the Service,
which we received on 18 January 2024. We can confirm that we have now completed our
search for the information requested.

You Asked

| am writing to submit a Freedom of Information (FOI) request regarding information related
to the organisation’s gas and electricity contracts, as well as details on the energy
management system.

**Gas and Electricity Contracts: **

1. Energy Provider

We can confirm that we hold the information requested, except as stated below. Please find
our responses in red for clarity.

Our electricity contract is with Npower and our Gas contract is with Total Energies.
2. Annual Spend for each provider for the past 3 financial years.

Gas

2020/21 = £187,636

2021/22 = £208,518
2022/23 = £421,909



Electricity

2020/21 = £366,599
2021/22 = £510,834
2022/23 = £758,320

3. Contract Duration (Including any extensions) 4.5 years
4. Contract start date 01/10/2020

5. Contract Expiry Date 31/03/2025

6. Contract Review Dates

This information is not held, per Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, due to
ongoing changes in our energy procurement processes.

7. Contact details of the person responsible, including job title

As the information requested in question 7 would identify individuals, we are refusing to
provide this in accordance with Section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. As a
disclosure under the Act is deemed to be to the world at large, it would be unfair, within the
meaning of the UK GDPR and Data Protection Act 2018, to provide this information in
response to your request.

8. Total Consumption of Gas, please provide me with the latest figure in cubic metres.
521,133 m3 for 2022/23

9. Total Consumption of Electricity (NHH), please provide me with latest figure in kwh for
the past 3 financial years.

2020/21 = 254,926 kWh
2021/22 = 225,850 kWh
2022/23 = 253,512 kWh

10. Total Consumption of Electricity (HH), please provide me with latest figure in kwWh for
the past 3 financial years.

2020/21 = 2,353,059 kWh
2021/22 = 2,569,739 kWh
2022/23 = 2,374,997 kWh

11. Contact details of the person responsible, including job title at the very least

As the information requested in question 11 would identify individuals, we are refusing to
provide this in accordance with Section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. As a
disclosure under the Act is deemed to be to the world at large, it would be unfair, within the
meaning of the UK GDPR and Data Protection Act 2018, to provide this information in
response to your request.



Energy Management System Contract(s) - Contract(s) relating to the organisation’s
energy management system. An energy management system (EMS) is a system of
computer-aided tools used by operators of electric utility grids to monitor, control,
and optimise the performance of the generation or transmission system.

Energy Management System Provider

Annual Spend

Contract Duration (Including any extensions)

Contract Expiry Date

Contract start date

Contract Review Date

Contract Description — A description of the services provided.
Brand of the software

Total number of meter points for electricity:

a. Non-Half Hourly (NHH) meter points

b. Half Hourly (HH) meter points

9. Total number of Gas meter points

10. Total number of meter points for specialist gases and liquids
11. Contact details of the person responsible, including job title

ONoOoOR~WONE

Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service does not have an Energy Management
Systems Contract. Consequently, this information is not held per Section 1 of the Freedom of
Information Act 2000.

The above concludes our investigation into this matter.

Any future correspondence with Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service in
relation to this matter should be sent to the Information Compliance Officer at the above
address.

If for whatever reason you are unhappy with our response you may request an internal review
by contacting DP@hantsfire.gov.uk or by writing to the Data Protection Officer at the above
address.

Should you remain dissatisfied you can appeal against the internal review decision by
contacting the Information Commissioners Office. This can be done online at
www.ico.org.uk/foicomplaints or by post to The Information Commissioner, Wycliffe House,
Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF.

Yours sincerely

Information Compliance Officer
Hampshire and Isle of Wight Fire and Rescue Service





